
Golden Eagle Silk Road Express
https://www.irtsociety.com/train/golden-eagle-silk-road-express/

Overview

The launch of the Golden Eagle Silk Road Express marks the next chapter in luxurious train
experiences, combining a passion of discovery with unparalleled elegance.

We are excited to announce the return to this fascinating region with a new luxury train and
itineraries. Embark on three extraordinary journeys through China, Tibet, and beyond along the
legendary Silk Road in comfort and luxury.

Read More

Each tour includes all five-star accommodations per your itinerary (both on board the train and in
hotels), all meals and drinks served with meals, arrival and departure transfers, guided off-train
sightseeing excursions, experienced tour leaders, complimentary tea, coffee, and bottled water,
and all gratuities.

The train comprises ten sleeping cars, two dining cars, a bar lounge car, an observation car and a
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storage car.

Accommodations

The Golden Eagle Silk Road Express carries up to 76 passengers across its ten sleeping cars. Nine
cars contain Superior Cabins (Twin or Double) and one car contains two Han Dynasty Suites.

All cabins have individually controlled air conditioning and heating, and include a private en-suite
bathroom with underfloor heating, wardrobe, personal safe, built-in minibar and fridge,
bathrobes, slippers, Dyson hair dyer and luxury toiletries. Complimentary tea, coffee and mineral
water are available at all times.

Superior Cabins
Superior Cabins are approximately 118 square feet (11 square meters), and have either two twin
beds or one double bed. There are 20 Twin Cabins and 16 Double Cabins on board.

By day, the cabins are configured as two sofa chairs. By night, the sofas are converted into either
two single beds (each 6 ft. 2 in. long by 2 ft. 5 in. wide) or a large double bed (6 ft. 2 in. long by 5
ft. 7 in. wide).

The cabins include a wardrobe, moveable single chair and stool, and the 26 square foot (2.5
square meters) private en-suite bathroom includes a full power shower.

Han Dynasty Suites
Han Dynasty Suites are approximately 239 square feet (22.2 square meters) and have a double
bed that measures 6 ft. 2 in. long by 5 ft. 7 in. wide.

A separate living room (15 ft. 6 in. by 6 ft. 7 in.) features a double sofa, a dressing table and a
dining table for in-cabin dining. The 56 square feet (5.2 square meters) private en-suite bathroom
includes a bathtub, shower, and double sinks. Suites also include a minibar and wardrobe.

Guests booked in a Han Dynasty Suite will also receive a premium amenities, including private
guide and chauffeured car service in many of the destinations along their journey. In-cabin dining
(on request), complimentary drinks from the Bar Lounge Car, laundry service and room upgrades
to the next available category at hotels are also included.

Dining

Meals on board are served in two distinct dining cars.

A Western-style dining car offers the option for banquet dining, a perfect setting for your shared
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journey. The second dining car is a Chinese-style dining car that offers booth seating. Both dining
cars are elegantly designed and catered with five-star service.

Both Western and Chinese options are available in both dining cars.

On select journeys, guests are invited to join a Gala Dinner in the banquet-style dining car.

Bar Lounge Car
The Bar Lounge Car on the Golden Eagle Silk Road Express offers an elegant setting for
socializing with your fellow travelers. The unique double-door entry, inspired by Han Dynasty
chariots, invites you into the refined and spacious atmosphere. Enjoy drinks and music as you
chat with fellow guests and watch captivating performances.

Observation Car
The Observation Car features a stunning 270 degree panoramic window to offer an extraordinary
view of the breathtaking landscapes along your journey. The intricate wooden carvings reflect on
the rich history of ancient Chang'an with a map and cityscape of the Silk Road.

One huge perk of this train: complimentary laundry service is available on board.
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